
 

 

Position Chief Information Officer (CIO) 

No. Of Position 1 

Qualification 

 B.E/M.E, B. Tech /M. Tech, B. Sc/M. Sc, BCA/MCA from a 
recognized University  

 Certification preferably:- Information Security/IT Risk 
Management/Cyber Security/CISA etc. 

Experience 

 Minimum 25 years of experience with recent 5 years as CIO.  

 He / She should have worked in Banking-IT related 
areas/projects involving IT Policy and Planning/Financial 
Networks and Application/Financial Information 
System/Cyber Security Technologies/Payment Technologies 
etc. of which 5 years should be at senior management level 
/managing or implementing IT projects in Bank. 

 He /She should have strong technical expertise and 
understanding of technology terms. 

Age (As on 01.09.2025) 
Below 50 years  

(Relaxation will be allowed for deserving candidate) 

Roles & Responsibility 

1. Managing the available Technology Systems, processes, 
software design and development, technology resources, 
Assessing the existing technology and process and suggest 
for improvement and upgradation.                                                                                  

2. Overseeing the execution of technology projects, timelines, 
resources and managing the vendors.                                      

3. Ensuring the implementation of statutory frameworks for 
strong and robust cyber security measures.                                                                 

4. Managing the inter-departmental requirements, 
communications.                                                                     

5. Managing the compliances, submission of compliances and 
reporting to the top management and board of directors.                            

6. Evaluation of technology vendors, partnerships and external 
resources.                                                                                                   

7. Managing the technology budget, optimizing the 
expenditures and ensuring cost-effectiveness.                                                                    

8. Building strong IT team to take care of day to day activities, 
operations and support the business and front end team. 

9. Aligning technology with business goals and lead cross 
functional teams to deliver impactful solution. 

10. Foster a collaborative, person centric culture that empower 
team members to excel 

CTC Offered 
 Compensation will not be a limiting factor for the right 

candidate and will be discussed on a case by case basis 


